



Freedom of Information Request

REQUEST NUMBER: HC/002822/17

KEYWORD: Roads Policing

Request	Response
1.Does your Force have Community Speed Watch Groups ?	1.Yes
2.If so, how many groups do you have?	2.CSW Groups - 112
3.Taking all those groups, how many Community Speed Watch volunteers do you have ?	3.CSW Volunteers – 989
4.Which Department deals with Community Speed Watch and where does it sit in your Force structure ?	4.Strategic Partnerships – Prevention and Neighbourhoods.
5.If you have a Force Co-ordinator what is that person's role.	5.There is no co-ordinator, therefore Hampshire Constabulary does not hold this information.
6.May I have that person's email address ?	6. speedwatch@hampshire.pnn.police.uk
7.May I have a copy of your Force Community Speed Watch policy and procedures ?	7.Hampshire Constabulary does not hold this information as there is no specific force policy.
8.May I have a copy of any written instructions that you give to your volunteers ?	8.Hampshire Constabulary does not hold information relating to written instructions. Individuals are invited to a training session to discuss the process involved. PCSO's accompany volunteers for the first few sessions.