



Freedom of Information Request

REQUEST NUMBER: HC/002250/17

KEYWORD: Crime Statistics

Request	Response																																														
1. Please tell me the number of recorded offences under s.67 of the Serious Crime Act 2015 recorded between April 3 2017 and October 3 2017. 2. I would like to know the age and gender of the victim, and of the suspect, and any other child sex offences recorded in connection with this offence.	1. 62 2. <table><tr><th>Victim Age</th><th></th></tr><tr><td>13 and Under</td><td>33</td></tr><tr><td>14 - 17</td><td>29</td></tr></table> <table><tr><th>Offender Age</th><th></th></tr><tr><td>Under 18</td><td>2</td></tr><tr><td>18 - 30</td><td>13</td></tr><tr><td>30 - 50</td><td>8</td></tr><tr><td>50+</td><td>2</td></tr><tr><td>Not recorded</td><td>37</td></tr></table> <table><tr><th>Victim Gender</th><th></th></tr><tr><td>Male</td><td>10</td></tr><tr><td>Female</td><td>52</td></tr></table> <table><tr><th>Suspect Gender</th><th></th></tr><tr><td>Male</td><td>40</td></tr><tr><td>Female</td><td>3</td></tr><tr><td>Unknown</td><td>19</td></tr></table> <table><tr><th>Offences</th><th></th></tr><tr><td>Sex Offences</td><td>24</td></tr><tr><td>Indecency</td><td>33</td></tr><tr><td>Child Abuse</td><td>2</td></tr><tr><td>Indecent Assault</td><td>1</td></tr><tr><td>Nuisance Communications</td><td>1</td></tr><tr><td>Public Order</td><td>1</td></tr></table>	Victim Age		13 and Under	33	14 - 17	29	Offender Age		Under 18	2	18 - 30	13	30 - 50	8	50+	2	Not recorded	37	Victim Gender		Male	10	Female	52	Suspect Gender		Male	40	Female	3	Unknown	19	Offences		Sex Offences	24	Indecency	33	Child Abuse	2	Indecent Assault	1	Nuisance Communications	1	Public Order	1
Victim Age																																															
13 and Under	33																																														
14 - 17	29																																														
Offender Age																																															
Under 18	2																																														
18 - 30	13																																														
30 - 50	8																																														
50+	2																																														
Not recorded	37																																														
Victim Gender																																															
Male	10																																														
Female	52																																														
Suspect Gender																																															
Male	40																																														
Female	3																																														
Unknown	19																																														
Offences																																															
Sex Offences	24																																														
Indecency	33																																														
Child Abuse	2																																														
Indecent Assault	1																																														
Nuisance Communications	1																																														
Public Order	1																																														

3. Please list all the forms of communication that have been recorded as having been used in connection with recorded offences under s.67 of the Serious Crime Act 2015 between April 3 2017 and October 3 2017 by text message, Whatsapp, Facebook, Twitter, Instagram, Snapchat, Kik and any other form of communication.

Other Related Offences	
Sexual Communication with a Child	3
Distribute/take/make/publish indecent photos of a child	1

Sexual Communication with a Child	3
Distribute/take/make/publish indecent photos of a child	1

3.

Communication Method	
Facebook	18
Snapchat	16
Whatsapp	2
Instagram	7
Text	10
In Person	7
Live.ly	5
Youtube	1
Playstation	1